

Cutting Edges: February 29, 2024

Bidders

DMC Wear Parts LLC
Kody McCollam 605-840-8082

BIDDER'S FORM
CUTTING EDGES FOR MOUNTRAIL COUNTY
F.O.B ANY LOCATION IN MOUNTRAIL COUNTY

ITEM	UNIT PRICE	UNIT
5/8" X 8" X 6' STRAIGHT (SNOW WING) THRU HARDENED <u>NO</u>	\$ <u>NO BID</u>	PER FOOT
7/8" X 5' X 4' PICK BLADE (BLADE WITH CARBIDE NUBS AND OVERLAY) **ITR Part Number: 238889 or equivalent.	\$ <u>157.50</u>	PER FOOT
NAME OF MANUFACTURE: <u>ITR</u>	PART# <u>238889</u>	
5 1/4" X 1 1/4" X 4' (with 3/4" Punch) CARBIDE BLADE **Sabre Part Number: SAB-48-UB 3/4P or equivalent.	\$ <u>186.95</u>	PER FOOT
NAME OF MANUFACTURE: <u>SABRE</u>	PART# <u>SAB-48-UB-3/4P</u>	
5" X 1 1/4" X 4' (with 3/4" Punch) STINGER BOARD ** Kennametal Part 1012353 or equivalent.	\$ <u>333.11</u>	PER FOOT
NAME OF MANUFACTURE: <u>Kennametal</u>	PART# <u>1012353</u>	
	Single Carbide Price per Foot	Dual Carbide Price per Foot
5/8" X 4" X 4' TUNGSTEN CARBIDE	\$	\$
3/4" X 4" X 4' TUNGSTEN CARBIDE	\$ <u>72</u>	\$ <u>344.00 - Kennametal 7/11/17</u>
7/8" X 5" X 4' SERRATED CARBIDE UNDERBODY **Nordik Part Number: 78548-Single / 78548-Double or equivalent.	\$ <u>no bid</u>	\$
NAME OF MANUFACTURE: _____	PART# _____	
CARBIDE ROTARY STINGER BITS ** Kennametal Part 1010937 or equivalent.	\$ <u>19.46</u>	PER BIT
NAME OF MANUFACTURE: <u>Kennametal</u>	PART# <u>1010937</u>	
CARBIDE ROTARY STINGER BITS ** ITR Part C87KCSBSR or equivalent.	\$ <u>16.21</u>	PER BIT
NAME OF MANUFACTURE: <u>ITR</u>	PART# <u>C87KCSBSR</u>	
OTHER CARBIDE ROTARY STINGER BITS NAME OF MANUFACTURE: <u>CATER-Double Carbide</u>	\$ <u>21.23</u>	PER BIT
	PART# <u>C87KCSBSR2CO</u>	

Page 2 of 3

OTHER CUTTING EDGES: SAB-48-UB SAB-36-UB
NAME OF MANUFACTURE: SABRE \$ 186.95 PER FOOT

OTHER CUTTING EDGES: Dmc 48GTR-HEXL
NAME OF MANUFACTURE: GATR \$ 295 PER FOOT

OTHER CUTTING EDGES: Dmc 48C Scarifier Board
NAME OF MANUFACTURE: GATR \$ 275 PER FOOT

RDO Equipment
Maynard Peterson 701-509-9711

ITEM	UNIT PRICE	UNIT
5/8" X 8" X 6' STRAIGHT (SNOW WING) THRU HARDENED <u>BB 5807244</u>	\$ <u>25.33</u>	PER FOOT
7/8" X 5' X 4' PICK BLADE (BLADE WITH CARBIDE NUBS AND OVERLAY)	\$ _____	PER FOOT
**ITR Part Number: 238889 or equivalent.		
NAME OF MANUFACTURE: _____	PART# _____	
5 1/4" X 1 1/4" X 4' (with 3/4" Punch) CARBIDE BLADE	\$ _____	PER FOOT
**Sabre Part Number: SAB-48-UB 3/4P or equivalent.		
NAME OF MANUFACTURE: _____	PART# _____	
5" X 1 1/4" X 4' (with 3/4" Punch) STINGER BOARD	\$ <u>355.34</u>	PER FOOT
** Kennametal Part 1012353 or equivalent.		
NAME OF MANUFACTURE: <u>Kennametal</u>	PART# _____	
	Single Carbide Price per Foot	Dual Carbide Price per Foot
5/8" X 4" X 4' TUNGSTEN CARBIDE	\$ _____	\$ _____
3/4" X 4" X 4' TUNGSTEN CARBIDE	\$ _____	\$ <u>345.00</u>
7/8" X 5" X 4' SERRATED CARBIDE UNDERBODY	\$ _____	\$ _____
**Nordik Part Number: 78548-Single / 78548-Double or equivalent.		
NAME OF MANUFACTURE: _____	PART# _____	
CARBIDE ROTARY STINGER BITS	\$ <u>17.00</u>	PER BIT
** Kennametal Part 1010937 or equivalent.		
NAME OF MANUFACTURE: _____	PART# _____	
CARBIDE ROTARY STINGER BITS	\$ _____	PER BIT
** ITR Part C87KCSBSR or equivalent.		
NAME OF MANUFACTURE: _____	PART# _____	
OTHER CARBIDE ROTARY STINGER BITS	\$ _____	PER BIT
NAME OF MANUFACTURE: _____	PART# _____	

ESCO Bismarck
Dan Goebel 701-400-4117

ITEM	UNIT PRICE	UNIT
5/8" X 8" X 6' STRAIGHT (SNOW WING) THRU HARDENED <u>NO</u>	\$ <u>17.74</u>	PER FOOT
7/8" X 5' X 4' PICK BLADE (BLADE WITH CARBIDE NUBS AND OVERLAY)	\$ <u>NB</u>	PER FOOT
**ITR Part Number: 238889 or equivalent.		
NAME OF MANUFACTURE: _____	PART# _____	
5 1/4" X 1 1/4" X 4' (with 3/4" Punch) CARBIDE BLADE **Sabre Part Number: SAB-48-UB 3/4P or equivalent.	\$ <u>NB</u>	PER FOOT
NAME OF MANUFACTURE: _____	PART# _____	
5" X 1 1/4" X 4' (with 3/4" Punch) STINGER BOARD ** Kennametal Part 1012353 or equivalent.	\$ <u>202</u>	PER FOOT
NAME OF MANUFACTURE: <u>XCAL</u>	PART# <u>GB224834G</u>	
	Single Carbide Price per Foot	Dual Carbide Price per Foot
5/8" X 4" X 4' TUNGSTEN CARBIDE	\$ <u>75</u>	\$ <u>NB</u>
3/4" X 4" X 4' TUNGSTEN CARBIDE	\$ <u>80</u>	\$ <u>NB</u>
7/8" X 5" X 4' SERRATED CARBIDE UNDERBODY **Nordik Part Number: 78548-Single / 78548-Double or equivalent.	\$ <u>NB</u>	\$ <u>NB</u>
NAME OF MANUFACTURE: _____	PART# _____	
CARBIDE ROTARY STINGER BITS ** Kennametal Part 1010937 or equivalent.	\$ <u>13.41</u>	PER BIT
NAME OF MANUFACTURE: <u>XCAL</u>	PART# <u>GW70</u>	
CARBIDE ROTARY STINGER BITS ** ITR Part C87KCSBSR or equivalent.	\$ <u>13.41</u>	PER BIT
NAME OF MANUFACTURE: <u>XCAL</u>	PART# <u>GL70</u>	
OTHER CARBIDE ROTARY STINGER BITS	\$ _____	PER BIT
NAME OF MANUFACTURE: <u>NB</u>	PART# _____	

Butler Machinery
Mike C. 701-858-1106

BIDDER'S FORM
CUTTING EDGES FOR MOUNTRAIL COUNTY
F.O.B ANY LOCATION IN MOUNTRAIL COUNTY

ITEM	UNIT PRICE	UNIT
5/8" X 8" X 6' STRAIGHT (SNOW WING) THRU HARDENED <u>Yes</u>	\$ <u>21.74</u>	PER FOOT
7/8" X 5' X 4' PICK BLADE (BLADE WITH CARBIDE NUBS AND OVERLAY)	\$ <u>No bid</u>	PER FOOT
**ITR Part Number: 238889 or equivalent.		
NAME OF MANUFACTURE: _____	PART# _____	
5 1/4" X 1 1/4" X 4' (with 3/4" Punch) CARBIDE BLADE **Sabre Part Number: SAB-48-UB 3/4P or equivalent.	\$ <u>No Bid</u>	PER FOOT
NAME OF MANUFACTURE: _____	PART# _____	
5" X 1 1/4" X 4' (with 3/4" Punch) STINGER BOARD ** Kennametal Part 1012353 or equivalent.	\$ <u>381.21</u>	PER FOOT
NAME OF MANUFACTURE: <u>Caterpillar</u>	PART# <u>309-2615</u>	
	Single Carbide Price per Foot	Dual Carbide Price per Foot
5/8" X 4" X 4' TUNGSTEN CARBIDE	\$ <u>No Bid</u>	\$ <u>No Bid</u>
3/4" X 4" X 4' TUNGSTEN CARBIDE	\$ <u>75.83</u>	\$ <u>No Bid</u>
7/8" X 5" X 4' SERRATED CARBIDE UNDERBODY **Nordik Part Number: 78548-Single / 78548-Double or equivalent.	\$ <u>No Bid</u>	\$ <u>No Bid</u>
NAME OF MANUFACTURE: _____	PART# _____	
CARBIDE ROTARY STINGER BITS ** Kennametal Part 1010937 or equivalent.	\$ <u>16.83</u>	PER BIT
NAME OF MANUFACTURE: <u>Kennametal</u>	PART# <u>1010937</u>	
CARBIDE ROTARY STINGER BITS ** ITR Part C87KCSBSR or equivalent.	\$ <u>17.65</u>	PER BIT
NAME OF MANUFACTURE: <u>Caterpillar</u>	PART# <u>571-0532</u>	
OTHER CARBIDE ROTARY STINGER BITS	\$ _____	PER BIT
NAME OF MANUFACTURE: _____	PART# _____	

Page 2 of 3